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on OCTOBER 17, 2012 · in HEADLINES 12:16 am

Fulani clash in
Benue

  TweetTweet 30  0

BY PETER DURU &NDAHI MARAMA
BENUE— No fewer than 30 persons were
feared dead in a fresh clash between Fulani
herdsmen and native Tiv farmers in Yogbo,
Guma Local Government Area of Benue
State. This came as the Joint Task Force,
JTF, confirmed, yesterday, that 24 sect
members were killed in Monday’s spate of
explosions and shootings in Maiduguri.

Majority of those killed in the bloodbath that
erupted Sunday morning in Yogbo were
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women and children who could not escape 
before the herdsmen invaded the embattled
community.

The renewed crisis also left several
farmlands and yields in ruins while houses
and huts worth several millions of Naira
were also destroyed by the rampaging
Fulani herdsmen.

*Umar…on the hospital bed after the attack
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Vanguard gathered from fleeing residents of
the community who had taken refuge in
Makurdi town that the arms wielding
herdsmen attacked Yogbo, a community
that is less than 15 minutes drive from
Makurdi town, at about 7am on Sunday
when most residents had gone to church.

According to one John Usher who said he
escaped with his wife and three children
from the sudden attack, “we never
envisaged any attack on that day, because
we have been living in peace with one
another for sometime now.

“We were surprised when the Fulanis
suddenly attacked us, slaughtering over 30
women and children who were at home
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when many families had gone to church; we
heard screams of women and children
being murdered by the Fulanis who quickly
disappeared after carrying out the dastardly
attack”.

He added: “Given the timing of this latest
attack on Tiv farmers, it has become
worrisome that anytime a year is coming to
an end, these ugly incidents always occur,
leading to the spilling of blood and the
wanton destruction of property and farm
yields of Tiv farmers by the invading Fulani
herdsmen. It is just unfortunate”.

Meanwhile, at press time, hundreds of
indigenous Tiv farmers were seen fleeing to
Makurdi town, while some were heading to
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Gbajimba from the troubled community
while security operatives were also seen
patrolling parts of the town.

When contacted, the Benue state Police
Public Relations Officer, PPRO, Deputy
Superintendent of Police,  Daniel Ezeala
confirmed that men of the command have
been deployed to the troubled spot to
forestall further bloodbath in the area.

Vanguard recalls that attacks on Tiv
communities by the herdsmen had, in the
last few years, led to deaths of hundreds of
persons especially in the border
communities between Benue and Nasarawa
states.

Efforts by both Benue and Nasarawa state
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governments and the Sultan of Sokoto to
find lasting solution to the crisis have
yielded little or no results in the last few
months.

Recently, the governors of Benue and
Nasarawa states also signed a peace
accord at Yelwata, a border town between
the two states to end the incessant
bloodbath.

24 suspected terrorists, 2 others killed in
Maiduguri multiple blasts

Meanwhile, 24 suspected terrorists have
been confirmed killed in last Monday’s clash
with members of the JTF in Gwange,
Zannari and Gomari Costain areas of
Maiduguri, while two others believed to be
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members of the JTF were killed by the
terrorists.

But the Task Force in Borno State said,
yesterday, that no member of JTF or civilian
was killed during the encounter, insisting
that about 24 suspected Boko Haram
fighters were killed in different parts of
Maiduguri metropolis.

A statement signed by the JTF spokesman,
Lieutenant Colonel Sagir Musa and made
available to newsmen in Maiduguri,
yesterday, said the Boko Haram sect
members attacked JTF locations in Zannari
ward and Lagos Street along Gwange
general area on Monday night where rocket
propelled grenades and improvised
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explosive devices were used by the
insurgents.

According to the statement: “The terrorists
used civilian homes as launching areas for
the attacks at different times of the night of
Monday, October 15, 2012. All the attacks
were repelled; 24 Boko Haram terrorists
were killed”.

The JTF spokesman claimed that no civilian
casualty was recorded but added that a
soldier was wounded during the attack.

He said: “One RPG purpose machine gun,
7 AK 47 riffles, 1 FNC riffle, 24 assorted
empty magazines, 950 assorted
ammunition, two pistols, large quantity of
assorted Improvised Explosives Device
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(IED) materials and several bows, arrows
and cutlasses were recovered from the
attackers.

The atmosphere in Maiduguri has been
normalized since the early hours of
Tuesday(yesterday) as people are going
about their normal businesses.” Musa
warned residents to desist from allowing
their homes to be used as launching pads
for attacks on troops and civilians, saying
such action would be dealt with
appropriately.
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@Bright Andrew, You mean no one can stop
the Hausa/fulani? Well, I heard
asiwaju/fashola & ACN may soon align with
the Fulani in other consign political power to
the far north.

Efes

I wonder! The TIVS fought gallantly for the
Fulani and Hausa race to take all the power
and resources of Nigeria. Now the Fulani
has power and audacity and have turned to
slaughter the    
Tivs like Benghazi turned against US
ambassador who helped them
overthrow Qaddafi. 

Ogelediezi
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Retributive justice! The law of Karma!! 

People ought to  peer into the future
before they take some major decisions
that affect them and others.May the
souls of the dead rest in peace.

Efes

 so mr  Justice77114Truth  your feel that you
can ,talk nonsense about Biafrans. on this
form .

 let those Fulani herdsmen , and boko
haram visit your home .and  kill all your

williams moyo
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family member ,stupid Iji Orimili

injustice is not good .who so ever , that
sporting injustice will die by injustice

Biafrans fight because injustice

we can see it right now Nigeria  .those
people and region ,that   sporting injustice
,are now get back injustice

Since I was a child all you hear or learn from
this group of people is killing,killing and
killing all year round,at a point I started
asking,is it not possible to ban people from
carry (dagger) knife around since it's as
deadly as a gun or is it in the custom of
Northerners to carry knives around?

chekwube 
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Nigeria gradually, but certainly, moving to
the edge of the precipice!

Master

...because leaders from the south do
not want to interrupt their cash flows
from the Nigerian project. They do not
know that the 12 sharia states of the
north have since formed their deserved
Islamic Republic. Southern leaders are
keeping those northerners in Nigeria
for now. And the more they keep them,
the more mayhem  we witness nearly
on daily basis.

Efes
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