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Reported cases of ritual killings have surged in Ondo State, a state that was previously not
known for such gory acts. For months now, law enforcement agencies have arrested many
suspects of ritual killings with gory pictures of human skulls, intestines and dismembered
bodies. Most of the suspects are youths, including teenagers.

Last week, a 31-year-old suspect, Yusuf Adenoyin was arrested by the police with eight human
skulls and fresh human flesh in the Isua-Akoko area of the state. Adenoyin said he ventured into
the business to raise N2 million to pay for his sick mother’s treatment in the hospital.

He told journalists as he was paraded at the Police Command headquarters at Alagbaka, Akure,
that he was into the palm oil business and cashew nuts, reselling them before he met the
human skull buyer on social media.

Another 30-year-old, Timothy Olaniyi was arrested with fresh human parts in Ondo town by men
of the State Security Network Agency, codenamed Amotekun. Olaniyi, who claimed to be a
trailer driver with a popular brewery company where he resigned in 2020, admitted that he was
caught with a bag containing two severed human hands and two human legs at the Sabo area
of the city.

He also confessed that he was promised N30 million after delivering the human parts in Lagos
State. Weeks earlier, policemen in the state also arrested a self-acclaimed cleric identified as
Tunde Olayiwola with a fresh human head.

A fruit seller, Dolapo Babalola, also narrated how he killed some of his victims, which include his
intimate friend, and five persons including his cousin. Most of the residents who spoke with
LEADERSHIP on the recent development, however, tasked the security agencies to be alive to
their responsibility of securing lives and property.
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A retired principal, Mr Akinola Adejobi, expressed fear about the upsurge in killing humans for
ritual purposes in the state. According to him, “Human life is sacred and nobody is given the
mandate from God to take another man’s life for ritual purposes. The rate at which the youth of
today are looking for wealth is very alarming.

Security agencies, most especially the police should be aware of their responsibility to the
security of our society. They should do everything in their power to stop the spread of this
dastardly act.”

Reacting, the Public Relations Officer (PPRO) of the state police command, Fumilayo Odunlami
, disclosed that the command is doing everything possible to ensure that the people of the state
are protected.
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